
Chapter 13

Chapter 13: In this chapter, Parvana and her sister Nooria engage in a heartfelt
conversation about Nooria’s upcoming wedding and her plans to relocate to Mazar-e-
Sharif, a city where girls are still able to attend school and experience more freedom
under the restrictive rule of the Taliban. Parvana is initially taken aback by Nooria’s
decision, particularly because she feels Nooria barely knows her intended groom, a
childhood neighbor. Nooria, however, expresses her intense desire to escape the
confines of Kabul, where she has been restricted by the oppressive social norms that
prevent her from pursuing her education or working. She is frustrated by the daily
responsibilities she faces, such as caring for her younger siblings, and views this
marriage as her only opportunity to find a new life with greater possibilities. The
prospect of a life filled with independence, education, and opportunity excites Nooria,
despite the difficult path she must take.

As the family begins to discuss the preparations for the wedding and their plans to
travel to Mazar, Parvana becomes increasingly anxious and upset. She fears that, in
their absence, her father may return from prison and face the challenges of
reintegrating into a family that is not present to support him. Parvana’s concerns are
compounded by her deep emotional attachment to her father and the uncertainty
about his condition, given the abuse he likely endured while imprisoned. Although she
fervently protests the idea of being left behind, her mother reassures her, explaining
that Mrs. Weera will stay in Kabul to look after Parvana. She also assures her that Mrs.
Weera will keep their father informed about their whereabouts. Despite this
explanation, Parvana remains disheartened and frustrated by the situation, her
feelings manifesting through her anger and a sense of helplessness. The thought of
being excluded from the family’s journey and the fear of her father’s potential return
in such a vulnerable state weigh heavily on her heart.



As the days pass and the family’s departure approaches, Parvana’s emotions fluctuate
between relief and sorrow. While part of her feels a sense of comfort knowing she will
remain in her home, the thought of missing the wedding and being left behind in a city
filled with uncertainty leaves her unsettled. The weeks that follow are filled with a
strange mix of loneliness and independence. Parvana takes advantage of the time
alone to focus on her studies, enjoying the quiet moments to read and learn with Mrs.
Weera’s support. Mrs. Weera’s presence is a steady source of comfort for Parvana,
offering her a sense of stability amid the chaos. However, despite the time for
reflection and growth, Parvana cannot shake the sense of longing for the
companionship of her family. The absence of the familiar family dynamics, the daily
exchanges, and the warmth of shared experiences leave Parvana feeling more isolated
than she anticipated. While she embraces the freedom to focus on her studies, she
also learns how much her family’s presence means to her, and the emotional gap they
leave behind is a painful reminder of how much she has lost.

While Parvana is selling items in the market, she encounters a sudden rainstorm,
forcing her to seek shelter in a bombed-out building that serves as a haunting
reminder of Kabul’s devastation. The building, once a structure of purpose and
community, now stands as a desolate ruin, filled with remnants of destruction from the
ongoing conflict. As she waits out the storm, Parvana is left with nothing but her own
thoughts and the oppressive silence of the war-torn city. The darkness of the building
mirrors the emotional state Parvana feels, as she is once again reminded of the harsh
realities of life in Kabul. As she drifts off to sleep, a woman’s cry pierces the silence,
pulling Parvana from her rest. The sound of the crying woman fills the air with tension
and uncertainty, leaving readers with a lingering sense of suspense. Who is this
woman, and what has led her to this point of despair? This encounter deepens the
mystery surrounding Parvana’s world, leaving readers to wonder about the lives of
those around her and the stories of struggle and survival that remain untold. It is a
chilling reminder of the ongoing suffering faced by so many in Kabul, where the quiet
moments are often broken by the sounds of pain and loss.


