
69. Free Meal, No Strings

The chapter opens with a depiction of a tumultuous scene in a city square, where the
environment is affected by unnatural phenomena like wilting plants and a cooling
atmosphere, yet some functions of the tower persist, such as increased pressure.
Kaladin, amidst this chaos, internally grapples with a storm of emotions and power,
drawing Stormlight to contain a tempest within himself. His use of Stormlight is subtle
but significant, enough to influence his surroundings without attracting attention. This
internal struggle highlights the ongoing battle between his desire to control his
abilities and the danger of revealing them in a tense, unstable environment.

As the scene unfolds, chaos erupts with screams from twisting spren and the
appearance of a Voidbringer descending from the sky. The spren, confused and
crackling with energy, scream like wounded animals, illustrating the chaos and
supernatural tension of the moment. Kaladin observes the Voidbringer, noting its
weapon—a long, spear-like lance—and its dark energy, which signals a formidable foe.
The presence of the Voidbringer and the spren’s disorientation underscore the volatile
nature of the ongoing conflict and the delicate balance Kaladin must maintain to avoid
detection and further chaos.

The narrative then shifts to a more personal tone as characters discuss their strategies
and social interactions amid the turmoil. Kaladin comments on the irony of their
situation—fighting a city in chaos while also attending a party—highlighting the stark
contrast between their dangerous circumstances and the superficial social gatherings.
Adolin’s attempt to blend in with a new, fashionable wardrobe underscores themes of
appearance versus reality. The scene also reveals social hierarchies and the use of
disguises, with characters adopting different personas to navigate the complex
political landscape, emphasizing the importance of appearances in their world.



In the final section, the focus is on the preparations for an upcoming social event, with
characters dressing in elaborate clothing and engaging in lighthearted banter. Adolin’s
efforts to look the part for the party contrast with Kaladin’s more pragmatic outlook.
The scene provides a glimpse into the cultural norms and leisure activities of their
society, where even amidst chaos, social rituals and entertainment persist. The
chapter ends with playful exchanges about food and fashion, illustrating the resilience
of social bonds and the human need for normalcy, even in the face of looming threats
and ongoing conflicts.


