
CHAPTER 10 -The beasts of Tarzan

As the confrontation between Tarzan, his wild allies, and the native warriors escalates,
the realization dawns on the natives that they are facing not just Tarzan but a
formidable panther and the apes led by Akut. Despite the initial advantage of surprise
and ferocity on Tarzan's side, his inability to communicate his need for release from
his bonds to the apes reveals his precarious situation. The situation is further
compromised by the return of the native warriors at dawn, preparing for a decisive
attack. Tarzan's despair is palpable, knowing that the odds are increasingly against
them, yet the sudden appearance of Mugambi, cutting free the bonds that hold Tarzan,
shifts the momentum.

The ensuing battle between Tarzan's motley crew and the natives is fierce, but the
natives are ultimately driven off, more by the terror of facing such an unusual alliance
than by sheer force. In the aftermath, Tarzan interrogates a captive to track down
Rokoff, revealing the Russian's fear-led decision to flee with canoes up the river.
Tarzan's relentless pursuit underscores his unyielding determination to recover his
son, despite losing the trail and facing diminishing odds with his depleted group.

Amidst this dire pursuit, a dramatic turn occurs when Tarzan thwarts an attack on
Anderssen, the Swede, by a native warrior. Anderssen, linked to Tarzan's son and wife
through Rokoff's sinister plot, reveals a surprising twist of loyalty and protective intent
towards Tarzan's family, countering Tarzan's initial suspicion of betrayal. Anderssen's
attempt at redemption in the eyes of Tarzan, coupled with his tragic predicament,
underscored by the fatal arrow wound, adds a poignant layer to the narrative. The
Swede's earnest assertions and his clear indication of suffering for a cause beyond his
own gain or survival stir a complex sympathy in Tarzan, redirecting his quest with
renewed urgency but now tempered with a nuanced understanding of the ambiguous
moral landscapes navigated by those drawn into Rokoff's web of villainy.



This chapter deepens the narrative by illustrating the volatile dynamics of trust and
betrayal, the unexpected alliances formed in the face of adversity, and the relentless
pursuit of justice driven by familial bonds. Tarzan's journey morphs from a
straightforward quest into a morally and emotionally complex expedition, highlighting
his resilience, the depth of his connections with both human and animal allies, and his
profound determination to safeguard his family, regardless of the psychological and
physical toll imposed upon him.


