
Chapter 26

The chapter opens with the aftermath of Amarantha's death, highlighting the
disappearance of the Attor, who is suspected to have fled to the King of Hybern. The
protagonist is in a tense confrontation, attempting to buy time and find a way to
counter the creature’s threat. The darkness of the woods erupts into chaos as the Attor
screams and is suddenly engulfed by shadows, signaling the intensity of the conflict.
Rhysand arrives swiftly, binding the Attor with night magic, showcasing his formidable
power. The scene sets a tone of danger and urgency, emphasizing the high stakes in
the ongoing struggle against the Hybern forces.

Rhysand interrogates the Attor, pressing for information about Hybern’s plans and
army. The creature reveals that it was merely following orders to capture the
protagonist, indicating a broader, coordinated attack by Hybern with allies in multiple
territories. The Attor’s trembling and desperate responses suggest the formidable
threat posed by Hybern’s forces, which are described as endless and imminent.
Rhysand’s calm yet commanding demeanor underscores his strategic mindset, as he
uses the interrogation to gather intelligence crucial for their next move. Meanwhile,
Azriel’s silent, lethal entrance adds to the atmosphere of impending violence and
military preparedness.

The narrative shifts to a personal confrontation between the protagonist and Rhysand,
revealing the complex dynamics of trust, secrecy, and emotional vulnerability.
Rhysand admits to having kept the protagonist’s safety as a priority, even if it meant
using her as bait. This revelation sparks a heated argument, exposing underlying
tensions about honesty and control. The protagonist's anger and frustration boil over
as she confronts Rhysand’s manipulations, feeling betrayed and powerless. The scene
underscores her internal struggle, highlighting her awakening to her own strength and
the realization that she has more power than she believed.



The chapter concludes with a visceral display of the protagonist’s burgeoning abilities
and her fierce resolve to fight back. Her rage and determination propel her to
challenge Rhysand’s teasing, even as he demonstrates his own mastery of shadow
magic. The scene is charged with physical and emotional tension, illustrating her
defiance and growth. Rhysand’s playful yet commanding presence contrasts with her
raw fury, emphasizing her journey toward independence and self-discovery. The
chapter ends on a note of relentless pursuit, as she attempts to track and confront
Rhysand’s elusive form, symbolizing her ongoing struggle to reclaim her agency
amidst chaos and deception.


